
BEFORE THE HON'BLE NATIONAL GREEN TRIBUNAL 

(SOUTHERN ZONE BENCH), CHENNAI 

ORIGINAL APPLICATION NO: 270 O F 2024 (SZ) 

[Earlier O.A. No.1006 of 2024 (PB)] 

IN THE MATTER OF: 

Suo Moto matter based on the News item appearing in "Deccan Herald" dated 
19.06.2024 titled "Karnataka Government okays mining near 1200 year old 
temple" ... Applicant 

Versus 

Central Pollution Control Board (CPCB) and Ors. ... Respondents) 

INDEX 

SI.NO. PARTICULARS PAGE NO. 

- Reply along with Affidavit on behalf of Respondent 
No. 1, i.e., Central Pollution Control Board 

01-11 

Annexure-I: Copy of Central Government 
Notification in The Gazette of India No-04 dated 

January 4, 1954 under Ancient & Historical 

12-22 



Monuments and Archaeological sites and Remains 
(Declaration of National Importance) Act 1951 

3. Annexure-Il: Copy of the case information in the 
matter of W.P. No. 25173/2022 filed before the 
Hon'ble High Court of Karnataka, Bangalore. 

2 3 - 3 4 

4. Annexure-III: Copy of the CPCB Regional 
Directorate, Bengaluru letter dated 20.01.2025 to 
concerned Departments 

35-64 

Annexure-IV: Copy of response received from 
Karnataka SPCB vide letter dated 15-02-2025 

65-70 

6. Annexure-V: Copy of Government of Karnataka 
Gazette Notification of "Commerce and Industries 
Secretariat" dated 12-09-2013 

7 1 - 7 5 

COUNSEL FOR RESPONDENT NO.1 

773|2025 
(J Chandra Babu) 
Regional Director 

J. Chandra Babu 
REGIONAL DIRECTOR 

CENTRAL POLLUTION CONTROL BOARD 
REGIONAL DIRECTORATE - BENGALURU 
(MIN.OF ENV,FOREST & CC, GOVT OF INDIA) 
BENGALURU - 560 079. MOB: 9868278903 



BEFORE THE HON'BLE NATIONAL GREEN TRIBUNAL 

(SOUTHERN ZONE BENCH), CHENNAI 

ORIGINAL APPLICATION NO: 270 OF 2024 (SZ) 
[Earlier O.A. No.1006 of 2024 (PB)] 

IN T H E M AT T E R OF: 

Suo Moto matter based on the News item appearing 
in "Deccan Herald" dated 19.06.2024 titled 

"Karnataka Government okays mining near 1200 
year old temple" ... Applicint 

Ve r s u s 

Central Pollution Control Board (CPCB) and Ors. 
... Respondents) 

REPLY ON BEHALF OF CENTR 1L 
POLLUTION CONTROL BOARD (CPCB) i.e. 

RESPONDENT NO. 1 

Ms. Revathi M 
Counsel for the 2"d Respondent 

СРСВ 

M-7448350555 



1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



REGISTERED NO. D. 221

The Gazette of India
EXTRAORDINARY

PART II—Section 1
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 4 ] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, JANUARY 4, 1954

MINISTRY OF LAW

New Delhi, the 4th January 1954

The following Acts of Parliament received the assent of the Presi-
dent on the 2nd January, 1954 and are hereby published for general
information: —

THE CANTONMENTS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1953
NO. 2 OF 1954

[2nd January, 1954]

An Act further to amend the Cantonments Act, 1924.
BE it enacted by Parliament as follows: —
1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Cantonments (Amendment)

Act, 1958.

2. Amendment of section 2, Act II of 1924.—In section 2 of the
Cantonments Act, 1924 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),—

(a) after clause (ii), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely: —

(iia) "boundary wall'- means a wall which abuts on a street'
and which does not exceed eight feet in height;';
(6) in clause (iv), for the brackets and words "(other than a

boundary wall not exceeding eight feet in height and not abutting
on a street)" the brackets and words "(other than a boundary wall)"
shall be substituted.

8. Omission of section 2A, Act II of 1924.—Section 2A of the principal
Act' shall be omitted.

( 1 7 )

12Annexure-I



18 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTBAOEDINARY [¥/ I

4. Amendment of section 4, Act II of 1924.—In sub-section (2) of
section 4 of the principal Act,—

(a) after ,the words "The Central Government may" the words
"after consulting the State Government and the Board concerned"
shall be inserted; and

(6) for the words "a cantonment" wherever they occur, the wordi
"the cantonment" shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 12, Act II of 1924.—In the proviso to eub-
section (2) of section 12 of the principal Act, for the words "Provided
that" the following shall be substituted, namely:—

"Provided that where a ineinbor of the Military Lands and Can-
tonments -Service is not readily available for such appointment, a Mili-
tary Otfioer may be appointed as the Executive Officer for a period not
exceeding three months:

Provided further that"
6. Amendment of Bectlon 26, Act II of 1924.—In sub-section (3) of

flection 26 of the principal Act,—
(u) the words "or the inhabitants into classes," shall be omitted;

and
(if the words "or class, aa the case may be" shall be omitted.

7. Amendment of section 28, Aot II of 1924.—In sub-section (2) of
section 28 of the principal Act, after clause (dd), the following clause shall
be inserted, namely: —

"(ddd) is a member of any other local authority; or".
8. Omission of Section 30, Act II of 1924.—Section 30 of the prinoipal

Aot shah1 be omitted.
9. Amendment of Bectlon 31, Act II of 1924.—In section 81 of the

principal Aot,—
(i) in clause (a), the words "or of the inhabitants of a cantonment

into classes, or both" shall be omitted;
(ii) in clause (b), the words "or class of persons" shall be omitted.

10. Amendment ol section 34, Act n of 1924.—To clause (b) of
•ub-section (1) of section 34 of the principal Aot, the following Explanation
shall be added, namely :—

"Explanation.—In computing the aforesaid period of three conse-
cutive months, no account shall be taken of any period of absence1

with the leave of the Board."
U. Amendment ol Bectlon 43A, Aot n of 1924.^-In sub-section (2) of

section 48A of the prinoipal Act, for the words "bazar areas" the wordu
• 'civil areas" shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 73, Act II of 1924,—In sub-section (3) of
eeotion 73 of the prinoipal Act, for the words "as the Executive Officer
may direct," the words "'as ainy be determined by rules made under
section 280," shall be substituted.

13



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTBAOKDINARY 19

j.8. Amendment of section 103, Act I I ol 1924 For sub-section {2) of
section 108 of the principal Act, tho following sub-section' shalll be
substituted, namely:-—

"(#) If any person, when called upon under sub-section (7) to
furnish information, negleots to furnish it within the period specified
in this behalf by .the Executive Officer or furnishes information which
la not true to tho best of his. knowledge or belief, he shall be
punishable with fine which may extend to one hundred rupees and
shaH also be liable to be assessed at such amount on account of tax
as the Board may deem proper, and the assessment HO
made shall, subject to the provisions of this Act, be final."

14. Amendment of section 113, Act I I of 1924.—In clause (6) of
sub-section (1) of section 113 of the principal Act, for the words "one
hundred rupees" the words "two hundred rupees" shall be substituted.

IB. Amendment of section 114, Act I I of 1924 In sub-section \1) 0/
section 114 of tho principal Act,—

(a) for the words "fifty rupees" the words "one hundred rupees"
shall be substituted •„

(b) in the proviso, for the words "two hundred rupees" the
words "tive hundred rupees", shall ho substituted.

16. Amendment of section 118, Act II of 1924.—In sub-section (4) of
section 118 of tho principal Act,—

(a) after the word "picketed" the words "or straying" shall be
Inserted-; and

(b) tho words "as if the animal had been found straying" shall
be omitted.

17. Amendment of section 185, Act I I of 1924.—In sub-section (1) of
aeotion 185 of tho principal Aot, for the words "six months" the words
"twelve months" shall be substituted.

18. Substitution of new section for section 200, Act I I of 1924.—For
section 200 of tho principal Act, tbo following section shall be substituted,
namely :—•

"2()0. Power to transfer by publif auction, etc.^Tho Board may
transfer by public auction, for any period not exceeding three years
at a time, the right to occupy or use any stall, shop, standing, shod
or pen in a public market, or publlo slaughter house, or the right to
expose goods for sale in a public market or the right to' weigh 01
measure goods sold therein, or tho right to slaughter animals in any
publio slaughter house:

Provided that where the Board is of opinion that such transfel
of the aforesaid rights by publio auction is not considered desirable
or expedient, it may, with the previous sanction of tho General Office!
Commanding-in-Chief of the Command,—

Co) either levy such stallages, rente or fees as it thinks
fit; or

14



20 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTBAORDINABY [BART ^

,(6) farm the B.tallages, rente and fees leviable under clause
(a) for any period not exceeding one year at a time."

19. Amendment of section 210, Act I I of 1924,—To sub-section (2) of
section 210 of the principal Aot, the words "or that the premises in which
the business is intended to be established or j ~ - : ~ i — i J — "J--ljle
for the purpose" shall be added.

20. Amendment of section 230, Act I I of 1924.—In section 285 of the
prinoipal Act,—:

(a) after the words "Officer Commanding the station", wherever
they ocour, the words "or the Board" shall be inserted;

(t>) after the words "before him" the words "or the Board, as
thi1. case may be" shall be inserted;

(o) for the words "he may" the words "the Officer Commanding
the station or, as the case may be, the Board may" shall -be
substituted.

21. Amendment of section 237, Act I I of 1924.—In section 287 of the
prinoipal Aot,—

(a) after the words "Officer Commanding the station", wherever
they ocour, the words "or the Board" shall be inserted; -

(6) for the words "as he thinks necessary" the words "as he or it
thinks necessary" shall be substituted;

(o) for the words "he may" the words "he or, as the case may
be, the Board may" shall be substituted.

22. Amendment of section 209, Act I I of 1924.—In section 259 of the
prinoipal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words "arrears of any tax and any other money
recoverable by a Board under this Act," the words "arrears of
any tax, rent on land and buildings and any other money
recoverable by a Board or a Military Estates • Officer under
this Act or the rules ma"de thereunder" shall be substituted;

(ii) for tho words "tax or rnonoy" the words "tax, rent or
money" shall be substituted;

(lit) for the words "growing crops or grass", the words "or
growing crops" shall be substituted;

(iv) in the proviso, after tho words "tools of artisans" the
words "growing crops up to the value of five hundred
rupees arid implements and cattle used for the purposes of agri-
culture" shall be inserted;
(b) in sub-section (2), after the words "by the Executive Officer"

the words "or the Military Estates Officer" shall be inserted.

15



1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTBAOKDIMAKY 21

23. Amendment of section 280, Act II bl 1924.—In sub-section {2) of
seotion 280 of the principal Act, after clause (k), the following clauses
shall be inserted, namely: —

"(I) the grant of leave to the members of the Board;

(m) the form of notices required to 'be sent under this Aot and
the manner of their service."

24. Amendment of section 286A, Act II of 1924.—Section 280A of the
principal Act shall be re-nuinbered as sub-seotion (2) of that section and
after sub-section (2) as so re-numbered, the following sub-section snail be
inserted, namely: —

"(#) The Board may, by a resolution passed in this behalf, dele-
gate to the President, Vice-Preaident, Executive Officer or Health
Officer, eubject to such conditions, if any, as may be specified in the
resolution, all or any of its functions under sub-section (3) of section
82, sub-saotion (3) or oluuse (b) of sub-section (6) of section 119, aeo-
tion 181, sub-section (3) of section 132, section 14!!, section 161, seo-
tion 163, section 164, seotion 168, section 169, suction 189, section 190,
seotion 191, section 194, section 195, seotion 196 or section 197."

THE ANCIENT AND HISTORICAL MONUMENTS AND
AROLSOLOGICAL SITES AND REMAINS (DECLA-
RATION OF NATIONAL IMPORTANCE) AMENDMENT

ACT, 1953

NO. 3 OF I954
[2nd January, 1954]

An Act to amend the Ancient and Historical Monuments and
Archaeological Sites and Remains (Declaration of
National Importance) Act, 1951.

BE it enacted by Parliament as follows: —

1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Ancient and Historical
Monuments and Archaeological Sites and Remains (Declaration of
National Importance) Amendment Act, 1953.

2. Amendment of Schedule, Act LXXX of 1951.—In the schedule
to the Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archaeological Sites
and Remains (Declaration of National Importance) Act, 1951,—

. (I) below the words, figure and brackets '(See sectiorl 2)'
the following Explanatory Note shall be inserted, namely: —

"Explanatory Note.—The entries in this Schedule are in-
tended only to identify the ancient and historical monu-
ments and archaeological sites and remains referred to or
specified therein and any clerical mistakes, patent -errors
or errors arising from any accidental slip or omission in the
description of any such ancient and historical monuments

16



22 THE GAZETTE OP INDIA EXTRAOBD1NAHY [TAB

or archaeological .sites and remains may at any time be
corrected by the Central Government by notification in the
Official Gazette.";
(2) in Part I,—

(a) 'in item 1, the following shall be added at the end,
namely: —

"except the following: —

Serial
No.

I .

i .

I ,
3 .
3.
4-

5-

6.
7.

Name of monument

ASSAM STATE

District Sadiya Frontier Tract
The stone boundary pillar of the Ahom period

BIHAR STATB
District Shahabad

Arrah House
BOMBAY STATE

District Bijapur

I n a c r i o t i o n s . • * • » . *
AiAW^'-^JLr' U U U t f . • V • • V ^

D o . . . , . . , , ,
Do* . * • • • « • *

District East Khandesh
Old Fort

District Mehsana
Old Vav or stepped well
Sun Temple

District Poona
8. "JNarayaneshwar MahadeoJTcmple.

Locality

. Sadiya.

. Arrah.

. Almel.
. Indi.
. Tambe.

Salotgi.

Yawal.

Modhira.
Khcralu.

. Pnrandhar.'r

(b) in item II,—
(i) for the words and letter 'Part B States' the

words and letters 'Part A States and Part B States' shall
be substituted;

(ii) in the Table appended to that item,—
(a) the following shall be inserted before the

heading 'Hyderabad State': —
"PART A STATES

ANDHRA STATE

I .
2.

3-

District Kurnool
U m a m a h e s v a r a s w a m i T e m p l e . . . .
O l d C a v e T e m p l e
N a n d a v a r a m T e m p l e inc luding t he Scu lp tu re of

S u b r a h m a n y a . . . .

. Yaganti.

. YaEantL

. Nandavaram.

17



10s 1] THE GAZETTE 01? INDIA EXTBAOKDINABY 23

Serial
No.

1 .

2 .

1 ,

2 .

3.

4-
5.
6.

7-

8.

9-
10.

i i .

12.

13- ,

1 Name of monument

BIHAR STATE

District Bhaxalpur

Patalpuri cave and land adjoining Bateshwar cave on
Patharghata Hill

District Muzqffarpur

J u m a M o s q u e . . . . . . .

B O M B A Y S T A T E

District Baroda
G a t e w a y o r T o r a n a . . . . . .

DistrictKaira
J a m i M a s j i d . . . . . . .

District Kolaba

B u d d h i s t c a v e . . . . . . .

J a n j i r a F o r t . . . . . . .

K a a a F o r t . . . . . . .

K h a d s a m l a c a v e s . . . . . .

T h a n a l a c a v e * .

T o m b s a t K h o k a r i N a j i k G h u m a j ( K h o f c a r i G h u m a j )

District Kolhapwr

B u d d h i s t c a v e s . . . . . . . .

K o p e s w a r t e m p l e . . . . . .

Panhalii Port .

(a) Ambarkhana.
(b) Andra Vav,
(e) Dharma Kothi.

(d) Naikinicha Sajja.
(e) Teen Darwaja.
(f) Wagli Darwaja.
(g) Tatbandi together with bastions.

District Mehsana

J a m a M a s j i d . . . . . . . .

District North Satara

Jhabareahwar Mahadeo Temple

Locality

the
. Madhorampur.

T J g] 1 nif y

* 1 la^lJJU-L .

+ P^-al, VtUJi

• VTUTllUSlU*

*D rtiniirl

Nenavali.

Rajpuri.

• JrOQnltl*

* ivniurapu r,
Dnnlinin
rannala.

Sidhpur.

Phaltan.

18



24 TBJ! GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTEAORDINARY [PART,

Serial
No.

I .
2.

3.
4 .
5".
6.

7-
8.
9-

10.

I I .

i .

2 .

3.

I .

a.

3.

4-

I .

Name of monument

MADHYA PBADESH STATE*

District Bastar

Andent sculptures in Danteswari temple
Ardhanariawara image

Chandraditya temple
Dantcawari Devi temple
G a n e s h Sta tues
K a m m a M e m o r i a l o r urasagat ta pos t . . . .
Kar l l M a h a d e o t emple
M a h a d e o t emple

M a m a b h a n j a k a t e m p l e
N a r a y a n t emple

District Jabalpur
Tapaimath . ' . . . . .

MADRAS STATE

District Ckingleput
Iravataneavara temple

District Tanjore
Alravftteavarar temple

District Tiruchirapalti
Prehistoric dolmens

ORISSA STATE

District Guttach
Churangarh Fort locally known as Sarangarhj excluding

the area acquired by the State Government

District Mayurbhanj
Khlchlngeawari temple ,

District Puri
Chaueath Yogini temple locally known as Mahamaya

temple • .

Locality

Barsur,
Bhairam.
Deo Gudl.

Barsur,
Dantewada.
Barsur.
Dhilmili.
Sampur.
Bastar.
Barsur.
NaralnpaL

Bilhari.

Big Kancheepuram.

Chattram Darasuram.

Pcyal.

Dadhapatna.

Khlching. -

Hirapur.

Churangarh Fort, excluding the area acquired by the State
G o v e r n m e n t . . . . . .

W E S T B E N G A L S T A T E
District Birbhum

Navaratna temple

Churanga.
Bhalunka.
Krishnanagar.

Brahmanidhi".

(b) after the entries as aftfresaid and before the heading
'Hyderabad State1, the heading 'PART B STATES' shall be
inserted.

19



Bio, 1J THE GAZETTE 0*' INDIA EXTRAORDINARY " 25

(c) in the entries under the (heading 'Hyderabad State'
and undor the sub-heading 'District Raichur' the following
entries shall be added at the end, namely: —

'19A. Rock edicts of Asoka on two hillocks, known as
Gavimath and Palkigundu. Kopba

19B. Ruck edicts of Asoka Maski'.

(d) in the entries under the heading 'Madhya Bharat
State',—

(i) entry 33 shall be omitted;
(ii) for the sub-heading 'District Gwalior' after the

entries under the sub-heading 'District Dhar' the sub-heading
'District Gird' shall be substituted;

(Hi) after entry 97, under the sub-heading 'District Gird'
as so amended, the folio wine entries shall be inserted, name-
i y : -

"97A. The following ancient and historical monu-
ments in the Gwalior Fort—

(i) B a d a l M a h a l o r H i n d o l a G a t e .
(it) C h a t u r b h u j t e m p l e
(»'('/) G a n e s h G a t e . . . .
(it;) G w a l i o r o r A l a m g i t i G a t e
(v) L a k s h m a n G a t e . . . .
(yi) M a n s i n g h ' s P a l a c e
(vii) R o c k - c u t J a i n co los s i . .
(viii) S a s B a h u t e m p l e s
(be) T c l i K a M a n d i r . . . .
(x) U r w a h l G a t e . . . .

G w a l i o r .
Do.
Do.
Do.
Do.
Do.
Do.
Do.
Do.
Do.

97B. Tomb of Abul Fazl ..Antrl."
iiv) the sub-heading 'District Gwalior' after entry 104

and the entries under that sub-heading shall be omitted;
(e) in the entries under the heading 'Mysore State' and after

the entries under the sub-heading 'District Bangalore' and before
the entries under 'District Chitaldrug' the following sub-heading
and entry shall be inserted, namely:—

District Bellary
8 A . P a r v a t i a n d K a r t i k c y a t e m p l e s . . . . . K u m a r f l B w a m i b e t t a ,

Sandur.'

(/) in the entries under the heading 'Rajasthan State'—
(i) for entry 36, the following entry shall be substituted,

namely: —•
"3#. Baoris old locally known as Hadi Rani Ka

Kund Todaraisingh";

20

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight

ADMIN
Highlight



26 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAOBDINABY [PAR'

{ii) for eatry 39, the following entry shall be substituted,
namely: —

"39. Laxmi Narainji's temple locally known as
Gopinathji's temple , Todaraisingh";

(g) in the entries under the heading 'Saurashtra State',—
(i) after entry 4, the following entry shall be inserted,

namely: —
"4A. Darbargadh Sihor.";

(ii) entries 8, 10, 12, 14, 17, 20, 22, 23 and 24 shall be
omitted;

(iii) after existing entry 15, the following entry shall be
inserted, namely: —

'15A. Old Parsvanath Temple . . . . . . Miyanu'

(3) in Part II,—

(a) in item II, for the words and letter 'Part B States,
the words and letters 'Part A States and Part B States' shall
be substituted;

(b) in the Table appended to the aforesaid item before
the heading 'Hyderabad State', the following shall be in-
serted, namely: —

I .

I .

3 .
3-

4-

5-

I .
2

3-

"PART A STATES

BIHAR STATE

District Bhagalpur
Ancient site of Vlkratnasila Monastery •

BOMBAY STATE

District Ahnednagar
Jarasangh Nagari . . . . .

District Amreli
Ancient site known as Gohllwad Timbo
Ancient site

District Baroda
Ancient site

District Kolhapw
Ancient site at Brahmapuri

MADHYA PRADESH STATE

District Bastar
Brick mound
Megalithic site containing Uraskala

District Jabalpur
Ancient site known as Karnabel . . . .

. Antichak, Madhoiam-
pur, Oriup.

. Jorvc.

. Amreli.
Venivadar.

. Karvan.

. Kolhapur.

Gadh Dhanora.
. Gammewada.

. Tcwar.

21



h 11 THE GAZETTE &F INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 27

4.

II .

2.
3-
A-

•I.

2 ,

1 .
3 .

District Sagar
Ancient lice

ORISSA STATE

District Mayurbhary
Prehistoric sitej

Do. . . . . . . .
U / O . * • . • * « «

R u i n s o f a n c i e n t f o r t . . . . .

P U N J A B S T A T E

District Ambala
Mound near College compound . . . , .

District Jullundur
Thch Gatd (Mound)

WEST BENGAL STATE

District Cooch-Bihar
R a i n a t l i t e . . . . . . .
T a k s a l S i t e

. Eran and Pnhlejpur.

. Baldyapur.
. Kuchal.
, Kuliana.
, Haripur.

. Rupar,

. Nagar.

Khalisa Gosanimari.
Do. "1

(c) after the entries as aforesaid and before the heading
'Hyderabad State' the heading 'PART B STATES' shall be
inserted;

(d) in the entries under the heading 'Saurashtra State'
for entry 1, the following entry shall be substituted,
namely: —

"1. Ancient mound. 1$ miles from the Brahma Kund
at Sihor.".

K. V. K. SUNDARAM,
Secy, to the Govt, of India.

PRINTED IN INDIA BV THE MANAGER, GOVT. OS INBIA PRESS, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE MANAGER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI, 1803

22



1/24/25, 4:59 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 1/3

23Annexure-II



1/24/25, 4:59 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 2/3

24



1/24/25, 4:59 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 3/3

25



1/24/25, 2:56 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 1/4

26



1/24/25, 2:56 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 2/4

27



1/24/25, 2:56 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 3/4

28



1/24/25, 2:56 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 4/4

29



1/24/25, 2:53 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 1/5

30



1/24/25, 2:53 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 2/5

31



1/24/25, 2:53 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 3/5

32



1/24/25, 2:53 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 4/5

33



1/24/25, 2:53 PM High Court of Karnataka Official Web Site

https://karnatakajudiciary.kar.nic.in/hckweb/casemenu.php 5/5

34



35Annexure-III



36



37



38



39



40



41



42



43



44



45



46



47



48



49



50



51



52



53



54



55



56



57



58



59



60



61



62



63



64



65Annexure-IV



66



67



68



69



Scanned by CamScanner

70



GOVERNMENT OF KARNATAKA

No.DMG/N{LS/CaI. C I 2013 -14 Office of the Director
Department of Mines and Geology
Khanija Bhavan, Race Course Road
Bangalore -1, dated:26.10 .20 13 .

By Reed. A/D

Sub: Hon'ble Supreme Court order dtd:18.04.2013 in
WP (Civil) No.562 12009.

Ref: Notification No.CI 79 MMM 2013 Bangalore
dtd:t2.09.20t3.

****rF
Pursuant to the Hon'ble Supreme Court order dtd:18.04.2013 in WP (Civil)

No.56212009, Govemment of Kamataka has cancelled all the mining leases falling
under Category - C. Gazette copy of the said order/notification is sent herewith for
information.

S."sr**,pffidi5R LPI r.' l, ?
fTo

"'Copy to Computer Section for uploading in the Departmental Website.

71

Annexure-V



RNI No. IIARBIL/2OOL I 47 l,{I

dmtrwd@
elQ{dason $dsBenubut)

aded oo% dgt

NOTIEICATION
No. CI.79:MMM.2O I 3, Bangalore, dated: 12.O9.2O f g

READ: Hon'ble Supreme Court Order in Writ Petition (civil) No.562 of 2OOg, Samaja Parivarthana
Samudaya & others [vs] State of Karnataka & others. With SLP.(C)Nos.7366-7367 of 2O1O,
SLP(C)Nos.3269O-32691 of 2010, W.P.(Crl)No.66 of 2010, SLP(C)Nos.L7O64-L7O65 of
2010, SLP(C)No (CC.No.16829 of 201O), SLP (C) No (CC.No.16830 of 201O), w.P.(C)No.al1
of 2O10, SLP (C) No.353 of 2O11 andw.P(C)No.76 of 2Or2, Dated:18.O4.2013.

A writ petition (Civil) No.562/2009 was fiied by Samaja Parivarthana Samudaya, (SPS) before

Hon'ble Supreme Court alleging rampant illegal mining in the districts of Bellary, Chitradurga &
T[mkur and encroachment by the lessees into the adjacent forest areas. The Hon'ble Supreme
Court had directed the Central Empowered Committee (CEC) constituted by it to conduct survey of
all the mining leases for iron ore in the above districts with the help of a joint team comprising of
representailves of ttre Karnataka Forest Department, tl e Department of Mines & Geolory, Hon'ble.
Karnataka Lokayuirta, and one member of the Central Empowered Committee.

After survey of all the mining leases by the joint team, the Central Empowered Committee
submitted its final report to the Hon'ble Apex Court on O3.O2.2012, wherein, the foltowing points
have been highlighted:-

(l) Massive illegal mining and transportation of iron ore by few individuals has lead

to severe environmental degradation;
(ii) To considering the quantum and magnitude of illegal mining activity, the leases

have been categorized into
Category A: where no or negligible illegality found,
Category B: wtrere marginal illegality found and

Category C: where gross illegality were noticed.

doddsdr, rbd,ruod, odgeaU Oe, gooA (¤EolDaB 9ee, dd ddE oeaae)
Baagalore, Thursday, October 17, 20I.g 25, Shaka Varsha f935)

COMMERCE AIYD INDUSTRIES SECRTTARIE'T

72



2

The CEC had recommended for cancellation/ determination of mining leases falling under
category 'C' and to allot such mines to ttre end users through bidding in a transparent way. The
CEC has further recornmended that the cost of implementation of the Reclamation & Rehabilitation
plan has to be borne by the lease holders themselves.

The Hon'ble Supreme Court in its Order dated 18.O4.20f 3 has accepted the
recommendations of ttre Central Empowered Committee contained in para M & VII) page E6 to E7 of
the said dated O3.O2.2O12 report, all the mining leases meaning thereby, falling under Category'C'
will stand cancelled.

Since, the above Orders of the Hon'ble Supreme Court have to be implemented in letter and
spirit, it is incumbent upon the State Government to cancel the mining leases falling under category
'C" Accordingly, all the 5r mining leases issued under Sec.B of the Mines and Minerals
(Development and Regulation) Act, 1957 contained in the list of "C" category mines appended to this
Notification as Annenrre-A shoudng the lessees nerme, Mining kase numbers, extent of area, lease
for which mining of minerals is permitted, location, taluk, district of the Mining kases stands
cancelled with immediate effect.

The Director of mines and Geologr is directed to recover any dead rent, royalty, penalty and
dues whatsoever compounded, Forest Development Tax(FDT), ta:r, fee or other sums payable to the
Government by the erstwhile holder of these mining leases which are cancelled herewittr. Such dues
shall be calculated by the Director, Department of Mines and Geologr and the erstwhile lease
holders of these cancelled mining leases cannot be absolved/ abstained from clearing the sums
under any circumstances.

Further, the cost of tle implementation of tlle Reclamation & Rehabilitation PIan shogld be
borne by the above lease holders of the cancelled mining leases.

BY ORDER AND IN THE NAME OF'THE GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA,

P.S. I(ANTHARAI
Deputy Secretary to Government (Mines)

Commerce & Irrdustries Department

73



{
J(
q,tiR
9E
+r ra

EE
a)c
qt
2

t.

hd
C)
ttl
L

U)

CJ

t<

da

k

{)o
lr

da

d
bT
l.r

li

O
bIL)
dac

!

o
&
L

(ua

bJ!r
i6
l-i

O
dbll"

da

{.)
E
tin

a

(6

6)o
Ir

d
da

!

og
oo

l-
ji
5F
?
1
(-)

li

&
E
F.
.o,o

tlc
5
tr

O
bol.

(g
o

L

r'1
H
l,

cda

t!
li

H

a

tr
v

F
(g

4
O

t<

,X

Fi

(d

1o

r
oq
lr)
d

U)

li(!
0)a
L
IJ
($a

(g
bI
Ii

t<#

O
dhI!

dao

li

li

a

a
(g

t-

a

L

J
EIt-

-o

H

CI

da

k
j4

F
ti)
lr

dp0

(E
l<

O
d
94

Ed
L{!

O

e

k

da

P
(d

o
k

(6a

N

i)q
!

Eo
cI
s

o
d
bJ

!

bI
dt

@
rn2

f.-(o
Ilo(o

Nro
z
a
g
o!

Ic

0oq
oz
a
{)tr
0.)

4o

d
=b/d

ca(o
ozta
C)!ro

0)
M

?
H(!2

,l(

a

cd

br

CJ

oo

lro
1ozta
s!

d
u)

a

o4ozxa

tri

ob!
H

a
rrz

obt

ariz

oP
d
J(
(U

d

a

6t

z
a

(!
oo

c)bl
d

H

rqz

b/
(d

q
z

(!
Id
dbId
o

M

(/
o

j
'ii
bId

oV
o
.i*zd
az(di
-badod

a

oo

=an

ro

z
>a
dk

li

d
cd
E

Ed
(d

H+troHXH;
-ali(!
oo

g

d

E

c(u
H

z

(,
b/

[laz

clk0
E
E
!{)5
+a

Loe

lo

x
otr
¤
t{

lio
k

olio
L

a
s
c.)Lo
li

a
¤
o!r

l-

j

d
C,)L

tr

d
C)Lo
li

ol'ro
l<

o
xo
o

d
q.)
lio
!i

¤
Lo
li

{
c)H

I

4v)
F(u*i !.!a2
olrob
lrv

oL

L

ok

oli

otio
L.

¤
irJSai

Foc
o,s
l-.

o
Iio
lr

C)L

oL

A{
olr

l.

C)
li

a
s
o
lio
L

N

5 o.r

-:t
>E
ot:
li '<
OFJ

li

CL

E

oE
E
oil
d
ko
L

C)t

li

tr

L

otr

L

otio
li

$3{Erlli
Ei
fr¤

s

(o

crj

(-9
c!
()
$l

tooj
$c! ;

N

lo
oi
i

oc!
ci

N o
crj

!oo
+

$q
H

F-
(o
c!
rro

t-
trj

Ix!
c4

o
qi

00lNlNNINIO
.f lcildCtlcDlc\t

(o
F-

cr)q
cY)

qoN
l.+
s

L..

(o
roto
.#

N
ot <$

N
c\
lc

()o
ct
s
PEE
E

o N
N

ro
(o
N

$rooN
o
(]o
N

co
c')
c\:

o(o
!oN

lo{clN
$
$N

@

N
6!o
O)

!o
00to
N

N,
F.

(o
(o
c{

ct(fJ

N$ ot-rocl
nsl
N

ro
c')
c\I

(o
(o
N

Cr)

tocl N
Dq\6
:N

o$N
oro(o
N

o)
ro
C\l

toNro
cil

(o
N
Cos
cq

D.ovN

l{()
E
os
ooq,
a)

lH
o
lu

'G,z

N
ts
n
oz

a
l.

'i
=*)

E
A

s
rn

Pu
&

a
a

z.

=U
Eaklz
vz
z
rdil
a7

a
rd

F

6

LJo

a
tr
FF
d
a
t-.,t
F

ul
a
z
aZ
Qaz
E
at

z
z
=o
F4J
(")

aa

z
i/)

ts42
az
o
4
c0

az

z
.i.:
o
z
z
a

F
J

a

fr)z
A
q
Z
O

U)

gl

Hh
d
3

z
).F

t-

ilg,

z

O

EJ>2,EBa4
F\/z<b)2
r+EE

o
rn

o
\JN2
a
z
o

a
{
aa

F
a

z
a
il

E

Z
a
z
lu?sa
<Ha2
-HfiE

R

r<
tu

ez
oz
a
Ez
E
o

E1<l

U?

z
z(-
2
IN
!-1

F

o.B
M

DJ
E1

trj

IJ

o
J

$

2

a
a
0.

tr
E

a

o

u]

drz
A

H

,4

az
=a

H

!.]

E<'t;kz
g

u2
H

ittz
a
Z
tz

t-

E
Fr
E
az
a
z
z
2
O
O
rno

&
X
d'

z
OJ
eo
O
(,z
Z
a
zs

Z

J<latut
3l

-:ooz N co + to o N @ o) o
H

F{ N co
'-{

$ !o (o. N
F{

00
H

o) IJN t
cl c{N co

c.l
$l roNI N

(o
N t-

c{ aN

$
FIil
D
XtIz2

ar{oo$FIo)oo
fis
EE
Eqll Fl
ER
E=o=
HH", p;
Pe'2A-Fl 5
HE

5E
ts
EH

Es

74



fca)o
oo
s!
F3
Eo
5
DoE
l0
lo
I}6E
l¤o
l0¤
H6oo
E
B)2
IJ
o
o
l0
le

(n
Os

ad
trE,:HB{En

HEr
ts 5'EF()E
?s.3H r'EuiS¤oi9e..o9

3E

Bd
IJ

{
J(
q,t{t

k+o
EE
{,

G,z

t\

t..

F
?
z
U

k
,ri

()

z
O

ti

H
th
B
z
O

i
a

+Jq)

a
ts

Ld
(.)
tr
li

a

E
(.)

l.

a

L{

o
0a
tr

cda

li

'}<

F
d

Z
O

tr
,.r(

F
E
z

i
.J
l!]

da

tr

L
r5

a

$
E]l.

cdti

L'
ut

a
Y

rr

!#

O
g0

a

Ld
='l

l-

a

t{

!r

c0

H
o
!
JE
da

d
oa
l.r)'u
a

o
,rl
li

da

lr

F

ri

!r

L

a

!

I
L<a

O
dii
Ll

oF

li
(g

o
iu
#o
a

t
{/

o
o)o

Eo
GI()
o.)

@

b{(s

ts
{
Ed

E,t

d
=
JJ(d(GtrLd5tro
OlrOE

+id
6il
()

oa

f..

2xa
(u

(d

a

k

d

d

L
bId

#
(!

ao

1,

bI
(d
(d

.o
D

C)b/
H(g
l{
CIaz

Lo
,jd

(U

(g

oa
4

E
oa

o
b/
Cd,r,a
?

o
IJ

I

ri

o
bJ
t-
C(!.

d

t
o
.a
I

!

4
a

E
\,/
'J

#j4
dJ
#
C)!
a.)

.)<
()

lfdbl

d

+

t.Ft
hJ(d

'o

(t

xq

o
lrl
Ea

EI

L
l/a

oL
O

d
H
(god
P

!l}{I

E¤t)
+a

E!k()
A

Io

cl

{
H

a

n'
o!
{\

{q)>
LH

otr-
i:d

JU
E

o

l-

I
ot{

.E
o
CJt
L

t

t

li

ok

l.OEO
c.i BOo
¤q)A>
joo
a

o!io

ti

|1

&
d
tr

!

oL

!

d
!)
Li

li

L<

ol.

!<

ti

X

0l

d
Lr

t{

Lio
oH

ri

li

ol.

t{

.b{
-+
tr EN4-vv
-dblgo>o-

-hE$
LU

ok

li

E{
li

t<

to

l-

!

e

E?
AH
ETfig

t*I
N

N\NN
q
!S

q
co

f..
(o

q !O
<,s

ro
(D

q
!oN

0olo
oroci

h.-

c,j
co

qsN
loq
r..

co
+

H

v
$

o
e
!o

{iN
t* 1

o)N c!

c0q
N

elq f..t
[o

luo
G,
e
u9eA
E

G)
t.
co

N
Nts
6I

to
N

o
N

00

c\l
co+N

oroIoN
cI$s

co<f
coN

rO

N cl
co(o
N

(c t-(o
N

|rJo
N

!ooo c-tN
!o
[ocl

c-tN
c\l

ci
c{l

!O
r..

f.
rro
l()ci

!o
toN

toloN

ci

H(,E
o
luoq,
{)

o
t)a
G,z

cl

co

g

r-.1z
q
p":t*

5*
r.1 5Z;
ta
ULal
20.

x,
LJ

-
tr
la

*,
z

d
0.

!

oz
oz
.;(.-)

+

J
E

z
z
E

z

u1

xazEa
4a

,1
(,
O
6
e
a
-l
U?
H

a2
z
z
-t

2

J
Hz

z
O
tuaa
t-..1

L5
(r?

frlz
=z
p
o
+
01

oz
ts

o
5
3

z

do
fr
H

zp
ts

D
Da
zz
&
q.

*O
d2\zUFA>tAap(+
x- ,4n -..

3fig<<zz-2Z<E
OMss

z
F.4

q

o
2,
z,
E
rzJ

p.a

a
lEla
F
t-.tz

HZ

I

2

F
S
3

z
a

oa
z

azoa{
a
a

z
(i

s
a3

Fp
*

EI

a
?
.7
.;

J
g

E
d

:)
r
N
d
Luea

ul

d
rn2

=;
.,h

a
d
4.1
A
a
5
+
Fz
;!i

a2 N co
F{ N

co
eo
co

$
eo

ro
ca

(o
co

1...
c{)

@
ca

9J o$ Ft$ N+ $ $$ ro+ s t-+ @\s UJ$ !o
F{

ro

75


